Date: 14th July 2021
Our Reference: FOIA-2021-066
RE: Your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000
I write in response to your Freedom of Information Act 2000 (‘FoIA 2000’) request, dated 21/06/2021, in
which you requested:
“Please provide the following in relation to the recent conference #Intersectionalityconference2021
1. All available materials including web links.
2. Full list of speakers/contributors
3. List of NPCC attendees
4. Identity of organisers”
Decision
When a request for information is made under FoIA 2000, a public authority has a general duty under
section 1(1) of the Act to inform an applicant whether the requested information is held. There is then a
general obligation to communicate that information to the applicant. If a public authority decides that the
information should not be disclosed because an exemption applies, it must, under section 17(1) cite the
appropriate section or exemption of the Act and provide an explanation for relying upon it.
In line with section 1(1) of the FoIA, I can confirm the College holds some information relevant to your
request. For ease, each part of your request has been dealt with separately:
1. All available materials including web links
Information held. Please see the four attachments titled:





Intersectionality slides
Workshop 1 – This is me
Workshop 2 – Equality Impact Assessment
Workshop 3 – staff Networks.

No other materials, including web links, are held by the College in relation to this part of your request.
2. Full list of speakers/contributors
The College does not hold this information.

3. List of NPCC attendees
The College does not hold this information.
4. Identity of organisers
Information held. Some identities have been provided, please see the list below. Others have been
withheld under the section 40(2) – personal information exemption.
Philip Cain – North Yorkshire Police
Marcia Francis – West Midlands Police
Marinder Kaur Singh – North Yorkshire Fire & Rescue Service
Paul Griffiths – Police Superintendents' Association.
Your rights can be found at the end of this letter. Please find an explanation of our decision to apply an
exemption under section 40(2) below.
Yours sincerely,
Kate Kaufman | Legal Advisor
Information Management and Legal Team
College of Policing
Email: FOI@college.pnn.police.uk
Website: www.college.police.uk

Section 40(2) – Personal information
Section 40(2) states that:
“Any information to which a request for information relates is also exempt information if(a) It constitutes personal data which do not fall within subsection (1), and
(b) Either the first or the second condition below is satisfied.”
Essentially, under section 40(2) FoIA (by virtue of section 40(3A)), personal data of a third party can be
withheld if any of the data protection principles would be breached by disclosing that data.
Personal data is defined in section 3(2) of the Data Protection Act 2018 (DPA), as being:
“Any information relating to an identified or identifiable living individual”.
Section 3(3) DPA defines an identifiable living individual as:
“a living individual who can be identified, directly or indirectly, in particular by reference to –
(a) an identifier such as a name, an identification number, location data or an online identified, or
(b) one or more factors specific to the physical, physiological, genetic, mental, economic, cultural or
social identity of the individual”.
As is stated above, the two main elements of personal data are: that the information must ‘relate’ to a
living person and that the person must be identifiable. Information will relate to a person if it is: about
them, linked to them, has some biographical significance for them, is used to inform decisions affecting
them, and has them as its main focus or impacts on them in any way.
We consider that releasing the names of those involved in the organisation of the intersectionality
conference may lead to the identification of a living individual, and would therefore breach data
protection principles laid out in the Data Protection Act 2018.
We are committed to openness and transparency, and recognise the wider public interest in the details
of organisers being made available. However, we also have a legal duty to ensure that the right to
privacy is protected. Consequently, we not believe that it would be fair to provide all identities of the
organisers.

Your right of review
Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 you have a right to request an internal review if you are
dissatisfied with our handling of your request. Review requests should be made in writing (by email or
post) within 40 working days from the date of our original response. We will aim to respond to your
review request within 20 working days.
The Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO)
If, after lodging a review request you are still dissatisfied, you may raise the matter with the ICO. For
further information you can visit their website at https://ico.org.uk/for-the-public/official-information/.
Alternatively, you can contact them by phone or write to them at the following address:
Information Commissioner's Office
Wycliffe House
Water Lane
Wilmslow
Cheshire
SK9 5AF
Phone: 0303 123 1113

Workshop One:
This is me! How do we
understand intersectionality in
the workplace?

Background information
We know that there are barriers to disclosing protected characteristics, recent research
commissioned by the Police Uplift Programme has shown that;
• Police Officers are particularly reluctant to share details on disability as they fear this will
remove them from front-line duties.
• Sharing such sensitive details repeatedly could be stressful to some, especially if
employees are unsure of how the data will be used.
• There are also concerns around the confidentiality of data
• Although this research was conducted within Policing, this issue translates across to the
Fire Service
There are unfortunate consequences when protected characteristics are not shared, there
is a risk of losing talent at application stage if data is not being collected at the right time,
as individuals interested in applying who require reasonable adjustments are not
identified.

QUESTION
How do we encourage people to share their
protected characteristics and say ‘This is
Me!’ in order to better understand
intersectionality within our workforce?

POINTS TO CONSIDER
In what ways are we capturing
intersectionality at the moment?

POINTS TO CONSIDER
What tools/mechanisms do we need to
capture intersectionality?

Workshop Two:
The value and use of Equality
Impact Assessments

Background information
Equality impact assessments (EIA) are a tool to help organisations ensure that their policies, practices and decisions are fair,
meet the needs of their staff and ensure that they are not inadvertently discriminating against any protected group.
There is a requirement to identify whether any groups of people could be affected adversely as a result of the
policy/procedure/initiative. These include the nine protected characteristic groups, which are:
• Age
• Disability
• Gender Reassignment
• Marriage and Civil Partnership
• Pregnancy and Maternity
• Race
• Religion or Belief
• Sex (Gender)
• Sexual Orientation

Background information
Under the Equality Act 2010, a public authority is obliged to evidence that during decision making; ‘due regard’ has been paid to all elements
of the General Equality Duty in respect of the nine protected characteristics, to:
Eliminate unlawful discrimination, harassment and victimisation and other conduct prohibited by the Act – this applies to all the protected
characteristics;
Advance equality of opportunity between people who share a protected characteristic and those who do not – having due regard, in particular
to the need to :

a) Remove or minimise disadvantages suffered by persons who share a relevant protected characteristic that are connected to that
characteristic,

b) Take steps to meet the needs of persons who share a relevant protected characteristic that are different from the needs of persons who do
not share it,
c) Encourage persons who share a relevant protected characteristic to participate in public life or in any other activity in which participation by
such persons is disproportionately low.
Foster good relations between people who share a protected characteristic and those who do not – having due regard in particular to the need
to :

a) Tackle prejudice, and
b) Promote understanding.

QUESTION
How can we address intersectionality when
completing Equality Impact Assessments
(EIAs)?

POINTS TO CONSIDER
What do you think would be the challenges
and the benefits of completing an EIA?

POINTS TO CONSIDER
How can we ensure that the EIA is kept
alive?

Workshop Three:
Staff networks and
intersectionality

QUESTION
Across policing and fire, there are a number
of staff associations that represent the
workforce, but many of these represent
single characteristics, such as race, gender
or disability. Can staff networks work more
closely together around intersectionality?

POINTS TO CONSIDER
What mechanisms need to be put in place
to make this possible?

POINTS TO CONSIDER
What examples of good practice exist?

Workshop 1 – This is me
Question: How do we encourage people to share their protected characteristics and
say ‘This is Me!’ in order to better understand intersectionality within our workforce?

Pre read info: We know that there are barriers to disclosing protected characteristics, recent
research commissioned by the Police Uplift Programme has shown that;


Police Officers are particularly reluctant to share details on disability as they fear this will
remove them from front-line duties.



Sharing such sensitive details repeatedly could be stressful to some, especially if employees
are unsure of how the data will be used.



There are also concerns around the confidentiality of data



Although this research was conducted within Policing, this issue translates across to the Fire
Service

There are unfortunate consequences when protected characteristics are not shared, there is a risk of
losing talent at application stage if data is not being collected at the right time, as individuals
interested in applying who require reasonable adjustments are not identified.

Workshop 1 – This is me
Question: How do we encourage people to share their protected characteristics and
say ‘This is Me!’ in order to better understand intersectionality within our workforce?

In what ways are we capturing intersectionality at the moment?

Workshop 1 – This is me
Question: How do we encourage people to share their protected characteristics and
say ‘This is Me!’ in order to better understand intersectionality within our workforce?

What tools/mechanisms do we need to capture intersectionality?

Workshop 2 – Equality Impact Assessments
Question: How can we address intersectionality when completing Equality Impact
Assessments (EIAs)?
Pre read info: Equality impact assessments (EIAs) are a tool to help organisations ensure that their
policies, practices and decisions are fair, meet the needs of their staff and ensure that they are not
inadvertently discriminating against any protected group.
There is a requirement to identify whether any groups of people could be affected adversely as a
result of the policy/procedure/initiative. These include the nine protected characteristic groups,
which are:


Age



Disability



Gender Reassignment



Marriage and Civil Partnership



Pregnancy and Maternity



Race



Religion or Belief



Sex (Gender)



Sexual Orientation

Under the Equality Act 2010, a public authority is obliged to evidence that during decision making;
‘due regard’ has been paid to all elements of the General Equality Duty in respect of the nine
protected characteristics, to:


Eliminate unlawful discrimination, harassment and victimisation and other conduct
prohibited by the Act – this applies to all the protected characteristics;



Advance equality of opportunity between people who share a protected characteristic and
those who do not – having due regard, in particular to the need to :

a) Remove or minimise disadvantages suffered by persons who share a relevant protected
characteristic that are connected to that characteristic,
b) Take steps to meet the needs of persons who share a relevant protected characteristic that are
different from the needs of persons who do not share it,
c) Encourage persons who share a relevant protected characteristic to participate in public life or in
any other activity in which participation by such persons is disproportionately low.


Foster good relations between people who share a protected characteristic and those who
do not – having due regard in particular to the need to :

a) Tackle prejudice, and
b) Promote understanding.

Workshop 2 – Equality Impact Assessments
Question: How can we address intersectionality when completing Equality Impact
Assessments (EIAs)?
What do you think would be the challenges and the benefits of completing an EIA?

Workshop 2 – Equality Impact Assessments
Question: How can we address intersectionality when completing Equality Impact
Assessments (EIAs)?

How can we ensure that the EIA is kept alive?

Workshop 2 – Equality Impact Assessments
Question: How can we address intersectionality when completing Equality Impact
Assessments (EIAs)?

Workshop 3 – Staff Networks
Question: Across policing and fire, there are a number of staff associations that
represent the workforce, but many of these represent single characteristics, such as
race, gender or disability. Can staff networks work more closely together around
intersectionality?
What mechanisms need to be put in place to make this possible?

Workshop 3 – Staff Networks
Question: Across policing and fire, there are a number of staff associations that
represent the workforce, but many of these represent single characteristics, such as
race, gender or disability. Can staff networks work more closely together around
intersectionality?
What examples of good practice exist?

