Date: 1 July 2022
Our Reference: FOIA-2022-055
RE: Your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000
I write in response to your Freedom of Information Act 2000 (‘FoIA 2000’) request, dated 01/06/2022, in
which you requested:
“On Tuesday 17th May 2022, BlueLight Commercial are hosted the first National Selected Medical
Practitioner (SMP) Forum at Ashorne Hill Management College in Leamington Spa, Warwickshire.
BlueLight Commercial have been working in collaboration with the College of Policing, Police Forces, the
NPCC, the National Police Federation, medical practitioners and providers to review the current
arrangements for the provision of Selected Medical Practitioner services across England, Wales and
Scotland. You will note that the college of policing is listed as a collaborator.
I/Please can you provide me with any information provided by the college of policing to the
aforementioned forum, re the above event.
2/ Please can you provide me with any information (after the event) that was provided from the forum to
the college of policing.
3/ Please could you (if possible ) provide details of the attendees to the aforementioned forum”
Decision
When a request for information is made under FoIA 2000, a public authority has a general duty under
section 1(1) of the Act to inform an applicant whether the requested information is held. There is then a
general obligation to communicate that information to the applicant. If a public authority decides that the
information should not be disclosed because an exemption applies, it must, under section 17(1) cite the
appropriate section or exemption of the Act and provide an explanation for relying upon it.
In line with section 1(1) of the FoIA, after conducting careful searches, I can confirm the College holds
some recorded information relevant to your request. We have responded to each part of your request
below:
Please can you provide me with any information provided by the college of policing to the
aforementioned forum, re the above event.
No recorded information held.

Please can you provide me with any information (after the event) that was provided from the
forum to the college of policing.
Recorded information held. Please find disclosure documents 1 – 3 attached to the email. Disclosure
document 3 is an email sent from BlueLight to the College after the event. The email contains two
attachments, which have been provided at disclosure document 1 and disclosure document 2.
Some redactions have been applied to the disclosure documents under the Section 40(2) – personal
information exemption. Please find our reasoning for this below.
Please could you (if possible ) provide details of the attendees to the aforementioned forum
No recorded information held.
Your rights can be found at the end of this letter.
Yours sincerely,

Kate Kaufman | Legal Researcher
Business Services
College of Policing
Email: FOI@college.police.uk
Website: www.college.police.uk

Section 40(2) – Personal information states:
Any information to which a request for information relates is also exempt information if –
a) it constitutes personal data which do not fall within subsection (1), and
b) either the first or the second condition below is satisfied”
Under section 40(2) by virtue of section 40(3A)(a), personal data of a third party can be withheld if it
would breach any of the data protection principles to disclose it.
Personal data is defined in section 3(2) of the Data Protection Act 2018 (DPA) as:
‘any information relating to an identified or identifiable living individual (subject to subsection (14)(c)).’
Section 3(3) of the DPA defines an identifiable living individual as:
“a living individual who can be identified, directly or indirectly, in particular by reference to –
(a) an identifier such as a name, an identification number, location data or an online identifier, or
(b) one or more factors specific to the physical, physiological, genetic, mental, economic, cultural or
social identity of the individual”.
The two main elements of personal data are that the information must ‘relate’ to a living person and that
the person must be identifiable. Information will relate to a person if it is about them, linked to them, has
some biographical significance for them, is used to inform decisions affecting them, or has them as its
main focus or impacts on them in any way.
In this instance, the information ‘relates to’ the names and email addresses of individuals. Consequently,
it is the College’s view that the information requested would fall within the definition of ‘personal data’ as
the requested information relates to living individuals and they are identifiable from that information.
We consider that releasing the personal data may lead to the direct identification of a living individual,
and would therefore breach data protection principles laid out in the Data Protection Act 2018.
The College of Policing does accept that releasing this information would reinforce the College’s
commitment to being an open and transparent organisation, serving to maintain public confidence in the
College and the wider police service. However, we also have a legal duty to ensure that the rights to
privacy of individuals are protected. On balance, the College of Policing does not consider that the
legitimate public interest would outweigh the interests of the data subject in this case. Therefore, we do
not believe that it would be fair to release the requested information into the public domain.

Your right of review
Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 you have a right to request an internal review if you are
dissatisfied with our handling of your request. Review requests should be made in writing (by email or
post) within 40 working days from the date of our original response. We will aim to respond to your
review request within 20 working days.
The Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO)
If, after lodging a review request you are still dissatisfied, you may raise the matter with the ICO. For
further information you can visit their website at https://ico.org.uk/for-the-public/official-information/.
Alternatively, you can contact them by phone or write to them at the following address:
Information Commissioner's Office
Wycliffe House
Water Lane
Wilmslow
Cheshire
SK9 5AF
Phone: 0303 123 1113

Exploring the impact of
the pension remedy on
SMPs and eligibility
NPCC Head of Police Pensions
17 May 2022

The entire responsibility for the
scheme rests with the scheme
manager

Scheme Manager
• The Scheme Manager is defined by rule 9 of the 2015 regulations
as being the Police Pension Authority.
• The Police Pension Authority for a member of the police force is
the Chief Constable. The Police Pension Authority for Chief
Constables is the Police and Crime Commissioner
• The scheme manager is responsible for managing and
administering this scheme and any statutory pension scheme that
is connected with it.

The Police Pensions Regulations 2015 (legislation.gov.uk)

Remedy
Legacy scheme
benefits 1 April 2015
to 31 March 2022
Reform benefits
underpin

PPS 2015 from 1 April
2022

Current Remedy Legislative Position
HMT owned: - Primary legislation
• The bill has achieved royal assent and is now an act of parliament - Public Service Pensions and Judicial Offices Act 2022
(legislation.gov.uk)
• Prospective now in force
• Retrospective into force by 1 October 2023
• Treasury directions now being drafted, will not be subject to consultation, expected in Autumn 2022

Home Office owned: - Secondary legislation
• Amendment order SI 2022/336 now in force!
• Consultation on retrospective leg of remedy expected to commence early January 2023

Tax Laws – HMT in conjunction with HMRC
• The statutory tax period is the current year plus the last four tax years
• The Registered Pension Schemes (Miscellaneous Amendments) Regulations 2022 (legislation.gov.uk) in force from 1 April 2022
• Government making further changes to the tax legislation using the provisions contained in the Finance Act 2022

Non Discrimination Rule - Section 61 of the Equality Act
• Section 61 of the equality act requires a scheme manager not to discriminate
• Has limited powers

Immediate Choice Members
• Section 6 to 9
• Pensioner members who retired between 1 April 2015 and 31
March 2022
• Beneficiaries of deceased members who died between 1 April
2015 and 31 March 2022
• Remediable Service Statement issued by 1 April 2025
• Member to make election within 1 year of receiving choice (max
31 March 2026)
Deferred Choice Members
•
•
•
•

Section 10 to 13
Active members from 1 October 2023
Deferred members from 1 October 2023
Make a choice at retirement

All ill-health pensions paid in the remedy
period are treated under Immediate
Choice and need to be re-considered.

No direct effect on injury pensions.

Expected legislative milestones for
remedy
1 Apr. 2022

31 Aug. 2024

1 April 2026

All members will continue
in Police Pension Scheme
2015 for future service.

First annual benefit
statements to be issued
reflecting move back to
legacy scheme

Immediate Choice members
must make election.

for the period 1 April 2015 to
31 March 2022 all members
will be placed back into the
legacy schemes.

All retirements and deaths to
receive Immediate Choice
(IC) RSS by 1 April 2025

1 Oct. 2023

1 Apr. 2025

Eligibility
Single Tier – PPS 1987

• Permanently disabled
• Inability to perform ordinary duties of a member of the force
• Service is enhanced on qualification for ill-health.
Two Tier – PPS 2006 and PPS 2015
• Lower Tier
• Permanently medically unfit for performing duties of a member of
the force
• Higher Tier
• Permanently medically unfit for regular employment (annual
average of at least 30 hours per week)

Single Source Ill-Health
Under the 2015 public service pension scheme reforms a ‘single source’ model for the payment
of IHR benefits was implemented in the new schemes. This can be referred to as ‘one-pot’ or
‘single pot’
Under the single source model, the member must meet the new scheme IHR criteria.

All payments of IHR benefits are made from the new scheme for the period between IHR and the
pensioner member reaching NPA in the legacy scheme.

Accordingly, the IHR benefits payable from the new scheme will contain up to 3 elements:
• (1) a tier 1 (or lower tier) pension in respect of service in the legacy scheme; and
• (2) a tier 1 (or lower tier) pension in respect of service in the new scheme; and
• (3) in the case of a tier 2 (or higher tier) IHR pension addition (the in-service enhancement).

PPS 2015 Permanency

Permanency ‘likely’ to
continue until the member
reaches normal pension
age or is likely to die (if
sooner)

Terminology
Re-considerations: Ability for the SME or Medical
Board to reconsider their decision [Schedule 1, Para 3]

Review: Periodic assessment of health [Part 7,
Chapter 5]

Re-assessment: To reassess as if it was the first
assessment

Re-assessments – HMT View
Where;
• An IHR application was under consideration before 1 April 2022 and the termination date in the relevant scheme was also
before 1 April 2022
• An IHR application was under consideration after 1 April 2022 and the termination date in the relevant scheme was before 1
April 2022.
• An IHR application was under consideration before 1 April 2022 and the termination date in the relevant scheme was on or
after 1 April 2022

Then the member’s IHR application may need to be reassessed in the alternative scheme at the same
date as the original assessment.

Relevant schemes must reconsider the member’s original application for IHR criteria in both the new
scheme and the legacy scheme (or section of the legacy scheme).
Where IHR criteria is met in one scheme, and by default they would’ve automatically met the IHR
criteria in the alternative scheme, there should be no requirement to reassess the original IHR
application.

Re-assessments – HMT View
The evidence available at the time should be used to make
the decision.
Factors such as a member’s subsequent recovery, or
continuation in employment following a rejected IHR
application should not be taken into consideration
Where some or all of that evidence is no longer available, the
member and / or their employer may be asked to provide
further information relating to their health at that time.

• Originally assessed
under PPS 2015
• Lower bar than 1987
and 2006 scheme
• Difference of
permanency between
normal pension age
and rest of life

Protected and Taper

Unprotected

Reassess?
• Originally assessed
under PPS 1987 only
• Will need to be reassessed under PPS
2015 to see whether
they are eligible for
higher tier benefits
only

Police Scheme Re-assessments
How will re-assessment cases be identified?
• Who will do this?

How will ‘regular employment’ be retrospectively assessed?
• Some forces SMP have considered 30 hours regular employment at the time of assessment under PPS 1987
but others have not.

Is it necessary for an SMP to do the re-assessment in every case, can existing file notes
be used to make a reasonable assessment of likelihood of permanency continuing
Can someone appeal a re-assessment decision?
Risk of re-assessing the lower tier criteria due to a change in health.

Common IHR issues
Reports being prepared on the wrong form/stating the wrong scheme
No specific instructions to SMP
Referring to the wrong legislative test in the report

Confusion between Ill-health and Injury schemes
Missing medical evidence or medical evidence that was not taken into consideration
No reference in the report to the medical reports relied upon and why, and importantly
why some medical evidence may have been preferred over other evidence

Disclaimer
•

The information contained in these slides are the authors interpretation of the current regulations.

•

Readers should take their own legal advice on the interpretation of any particular piece of
legislation.

•

No responsibility whatsoever will be assumed by NPCC for any direct or consequential loss,
financial or otherwise, damage or inconvenience, or any other obligation or liability incurred by
readers relying on information contained in these slides.

Thank you for listening

National Selected
Medical Practitioner
Forum
17th May 2022

Agenda
09:30-10:00

Arrival and refreshments

10:00-10:30

Welcome, purpose of the forum and introductions
Rachel Britt, Commercial Specialist – BlueLight Commercial

10:30-10:40

Appointment of Forum Chair
Commercial Specialist – BlueLight Commercial

10:40-11:00

Terms of Reference sign off
Forum Chair
15-minute refreshment break

11:15-12:00

SMP Forum action plan update
Forum Chair
Lunch and networking 12.00-12:30

12:40-13:40

Exploring the impact of the new pension remedy on SMPs and eligibility
NPCC Head of Police Pensions

13:40-14:40

Next steps agreed
Forum Chair

14:40-15:00

Any other business
Forum Chair

15:00

Forum close

Welcome, purpose of the
forum and introductions

Background

September 2021
Regional workshops

November 2021

May 2022

Market engagement

SMP Forum

Working groups commenced

Scoping out for SMP Forum

October 2021

January 2022

What's working well?

What do we want?

What do we need to do?

Appointment of Chair

Terms of Reference

15-minute
Refreshment Break

Action Plan Update

Action Plan
Ref.

Action

Lead

Timescales

Progress

1

Engage with the market to
understand what would encourage
more medical practitioners to work
as an SMP

BlueLight
Commercial

Q3 & Q4
2021-22

Separate update report provided.

2

Develop ways to improve the
support and training for SMPs and
prospective SMPs.

BlueLight
Commercial

Q1 2022-23

National quarterly Forum established from
May 2022. Training will form part of each
meeting and further opportunities identified.

3

Work with Forces to understand the BlueLight
demand, service requirements and Commercial
cost of a national service

Q3 & Q4
2021-22

Separate update report provided.

4

Develop a commercial strategy for
SMP services.

Blue Light
Commercial

By Q3
2022-23

Work to be driven via the forum (agenda item
6).

5

Develop guidance for Staff
to ensure that there is
good understanding of the role of
an SMP and to manage
expectations

College
of Policing

TBC

Work to be driven via the forum (agenda
item 6).

6

Implementation of the SMP
commercial strategy.

Blue Light
Commercial

From Q3
onwards

Work to be driven via the forum
(agenda item 6).

Action Plan Ref.1 Update
• What has the market told us?
• We need supplier engagement and buy-in
• We need to understand the difference between FMA's and SMP's
• Burden on decision making, no consistency on managing challenges
• Need more support and training for practitioners
• Expensive process and not an attractive job role
• We need a more diverse workforce
• Police staff don't always understand the process
• Who did we meet with?
• Optima Health
• Crown Commercial Services (CCS)
• National Police Chief Council (NPCC)
• Police Medical Appeal Board (PMAB)
• Police Federation (POLFED)
• College of Policing
• Sugarman Medical and Mind
• Medigold Health

Action Plan Ref.3 Update
• Data compiled for 21 forces
• Mixed contracting model with 43% of forces through a provider

• Medigold Health and Healthworks have the biggest share of the market
• Most forces aren’t experiencing a backlog in cases. Of the 3 that are, it is
not directly related to the SMP service
• A total of 89 cases were referred across the forces that returned data

• On average 2-3 cases were appealed per force
• Between 1-6 cases were overturned on appeal
• Average spend per head in 2020/21 was £1,847

Action Plan Ref.3 Update

Injury and ill health spend (CIPFA)

Total number of medical retirements (CIPFA)

Lunch and
networking

Exploring the impact of the
new pension remedy on SMPs
and eligibility

Next Steps

Action Plan
Ref.

Action

Lead

Timescales

Progress

1

Engage with the market to
understand what would encourage
more medical practitioners to work
as an SMP

BlueLight
Commercial

Q3 & Q4
2021-22

Separate update report provided.

2

Develop ways to improve the
support and training for SMPs and
prospective SMPs.

BlueLight
Commercial

Q1 2022-23

National quarterly Forum established from
May 2022. Training will form part of each
meeting and further opportunities identified.

3

Work with Forces to understand the BlueLight
demand, service requirements and Commercial
cost of a national service

Q3 & Q4
2021-22

Separate update report provided.

4

Develop a commercial strategy for
SMP services.

Blue Light
Commercial

By Q3
2022-23

Work to be driven via the forum (agenda item
6).

5

Develop guidance for Staff
to ensure that there is
good understanding of the role of
an SMP and to manage
expectations

College
of Policing

TBC

Work to be driven via the forum (agenda
item 6).

6

Implementation of the SMP
commercial strategy.

Blue Light
Commercial

From Q3
onwards

Work to be driven via the forum
(agenda item 6).

Next Steps

Any Other Business

