
Date: 28 September 2022 

Our Reference: FOIA-2022-085 

RE: Freedom of Information Act 2000 Request 

I write in response to your Freedom of Information Act 2000 (or ‘FoIA 2000’) request dated 5 September 

in which you requested 

1. A detailed breakdown of the syllabus (module names and brief details of subjects covered) for 

any training courses offered with regards to coercive control, manipulation and other kinds of 

emotional domestic abuse. 

2. A confirmation of whether teams from Coventry Central Police Station has undertaken any of 

these courses in the last 24 months. 

3. Confirmation of whether any courses cover ‘reactive abuse’ namely where behaviour appears to 

be abuse but it is, in fact, merely a reaction to abuse in the other direction. 

4. Confirmation of whether any courses cover the fact that abuse can manifest in false criminal 

allegations being made, again making it appear that the victim is the aggressor. 

5. A confirmation of whether teams from Coventry Central Police Station have covered items in 3&4 

in the last 24 months. 

6. A list of all ‘domestic abuse courses’ given to Coventry Central Police Station in the last 24 

months. 

When a request for information is made under FoIA 2000, a public authority has a general duty under 

section 1(1) of the Act to inform an applicant whether the requested information is held. There is then a 

general obligation to communicate that information to the applicant. If a public authority decides that the 

information should not be disclosed because an exemption applies, it must, under section 17(1) cite the 

appropriate section or exemption of the Act and provide an explanation for relying upon it. 

It is important to note that a freedom of information request is not a private transaction. Both the request 

itself and any information disclosed are considered suitable for open publication, that is, once access to 



information is granted to one person under the legislation, it is then considered public information and 

must be communicated to any individual should a request be received. In light of this, our responses and 

disclosures are published on our external website at a later date. 

Decision 

After conducting careful searches relating to your request, I can confirm there is information held in relation 

to some aspects of your request. I have addressed each part of your request in turn below. 

1. A detailed breakdown of the syllabus (module names and brief details of subjects 

covered) for any training courses offered with regards to coercive control, manipulation 

and other kinds of emotional domestic abuse. 

Please find attached (Disclosure 1) an extract from the trainer guide for our Domestic Abuse 

(DA) Matters course, which sets out the content of the training and the delivery. DA matters is our 

main training course that covers controlling and coercive behaviour in depth. 

2. A confirmation of whether teams from Coventry Central Police Station has undertaken any 

of these courses in the last 24 months. 

No information held. We can confirm that West Midlands are licenced to deliver DA Matters, 

however do not hold this information relating to local delivery. Further information about the 

licence and the course itself can be accessed here: https://www.college.police.uk/career-

learning/licensed-products/domestic-abuse-da-matters-change-programme 

3. Confirmation of whether any courses cover ‘reactive abuse’ namely where behaviour 

appears to be abuse but it is, in fact, merely a reaction to abuse in the other direction. 

This forms part of the learning in DA matters. It is also part of the DA national toolkit and the 

subject is covered in depth with our Authorised Professional Practice (APP), which can be 

accessed in full here: https://www.college.police.uk/app/major-investigation-and-public-

protection/domestic-abuse. I have also attached an extract from this APP for ease of reference 

(Disclosure 2). Forces align their local policy and training to our APP. 

https://www.college.police.uk/app/major-investigation-and-public
https://www.college.police.uk/career


4. Confirmation of whether any courses cover the fact that abuse can manifest in false 

criminal allegations being made, again making it appear that the victim is the aggressor. 

Yes this is covered in the resources as listed in the response to question 3. 

5. A confirmation of whether teams from Coventry Central Police Station have covered items 

in 3&4 in the last 24 months. 

No information held. 

6. A list of all ‘domestic abuse courses’ given to Coventry Central Police Station in the last 

24 months 

No information held. We make a number of products available to forces through our College 

Learn online learning platform, however do not hold information on what is delivered locally. You 

may wish to contact West Midlands police force for further, specific information. Information on 

how to do this can be found here https://foi.west-midlands.police.uk/ 

In relation to the attached disclosures, please be advised that the information supplied to you is and 

continues to be protected by Copyright law. Unless expressly permitted by law, any re-use, adaptation 

or sharing of College information, in whole or in part, requires permission from the College of Policing. 

To request permission please contact the College’s Copyright and Licensing Team at 

Copyright&Licensing@college.pnn.police.uk 

I trust this letter answers your questions. Your rights are provided in Appendix A. 

Yours sincerely, 

Sarah Lawrence | Legal Services Manager 

Information Management and Legal Team 

College of Policing 

Email: FOI@college.pnn.police.uk 

Website: www.college.police.uk 

www.college.police.uk
mailto:FOI@college.pnn.police.uk
mailto:Copyright&Licensing@college.pnn.police.uk
https://foi.west-midlands.police.uk


Appendix A 

Rights 

If you are dissatisfied with the handling procedures or the decision of the College of Policing made under 

the Freedom of Information Act 2000 (the Act) regarding access to information you can request that the 

decision is reviewed internally. 

Internal review requests should be made in writing, within forty (40) working days from the date of the 

refusal notice, and addressed to: FOI team, Central House, Beckwith Knowle, Otley Road, Harrogate, 

North Yorkshire, HG3 1UF or email: FOI@college.pnn.police.uk 

In all possible circumstances the College of Policing will aim to respond to your request for internal review 

within 20 working days. 

The Information Commissioner 

If, after lodging an internal review request with the College of Policing you are still dissatisfied with the 

decision you may make application to the Information Commissioner for a decision on whether the request 

for information has been dealt with in accordance with the requirements of the Act. 

For information on how to make application to the Information Commissioner please visit their website at 

https://ico.org.uk/for-the-public/official-information/. 

Alternatively, write to: 

Information Commissioner's Office 

Wycliffe House 

Water Lane 

Wilmslow 

Cheshire 

SK9 5AF 

Phone: 0303 123 1113 

https://ico.org.uk/for-the-public/official-information
mailto:FOI@college.pnn.police.uk


DA Matters First Responder training 

Contents 

Introduction ........................................................................................................................... 2 

Session 2 – Dynamics of Domestic Abuse............................. Error! Bookmark not defined. 

Session 3 – Reality of Domestic Abuse.................................. Error! Bookmark not defined. 

Session 4 – Responding to Domestic Abuse.......................... Error! Bookmark not defined. 

Session 5 – Course Closure................................................... Error! Bookmark not defined. 

Additional Information ............................................................ Error! Bookmark not defined. 

Appendix A – Signs and Symptoms of Strangulation ............. Error! Bookmark not defined. 

References ............................................................................ Error! Bookmark not defined. 



Introduction 

Learning overview 

The College of Policing and the domestic abuse charity, SafeLives, worked with key 

stakeholders to develop ‘Domestic Abuse Matters’, a bespoke cultural change 

programme for police officers and staff in England and Wales. It has been designed 

to transform the response to domestic abuse, ensuring the voice of the victim is 

placed at the centre, and controlling and coercive behaviour is better understood. 

The programme is designed to have long-term impact: changing and challenging the 

attitudes, culture and behaviour of the police when responding to domestic abuse. 

Now maintained by the Editorial Board, it aims to equip the learner with knowledge 

and specific skills to enable them to provide an appropriate response to domestic 

abuse outlined in the findings of Her Majesty’s Inspector of Constabulary (Formally 

HMIC) HMICFRS report “Everyone’s business: Improving the police response to 

domestic abuse”. (2014) 

Target audience 

This learning is intended for those who provide the initial response to domestic 

abuse cases. 

Trainer/learner ratio 

The facilitator/learner is maximum 25 learners to 2 trainers. 

Purpose of the trainer guide 

This guide is developed to direct you through the delivery of the training for Domestic 

Abuse (DA) Matters Change Programme for first responders. It is important that you 

read the guide in full, prior to delivery of any learning associated with this 

programme. The guide will provide you with essential information on training delivery 

and learning resources needed. 

Learning duration 

This learning is one training day (7 hours) in duration 



Learning summary 

The aim of this programme is to enable first responders to improve their 

responsiveness to domestic abuse cases as outlined in the HMICFRS report 

“Everyone’s business: Improving the police response to domestic abuse” (2014) 

Learning outcomes 

The learning outcomes for the programme: 

 Define what is meant by the term ‘domestic abuse’ 

 Explain the role of the first responder and DA Matters Champion in the DA 

Matters change programme 

 Explain what is meant by the term “coercive control” and how to discover 

evidence of coercive control using appropriate questions and communication 

techniques. 

 Describe the effect of multiple controlling behaviours on victims, other 

vulnerable persons and children impacted by the perpetrator’s behaviour 

 Identify why victims can find it difficult to leave an abusive relationship and how 

hard perpetrators work to resist their victim leaving an abusive relationship 

 Identify the stages of change a victim experiences when in and preparing to 

leave an abusive relationship and how this impacts on them as responders 

 Describe what intervention responders can provide to a victim at each stage of 

an abusive relationship 

 Specify the link between coercive control and stalking or harassment 

 Explain best practice when recording and reporting the responses to domestic 

abuse incidents which can maximise evidential value and minimise victim 

blaming 

 Describe the tactics perpetrators may use to manipulate first responders 

 Describe the importance of securing evidence at the scene of a domestic 

abuse incident 

 Identify the need and potential options to safeguard victims and children 



 Explain how intersecting social identities impact on victims’ experience of 

domestic abuse and discrimination. 



Determining the primary perpetrator and 
dealing with counter-allegations 
Officers should avoid jumping to conclusions about which of the parties in 
the relationship is the victim and which the perpetrator. This applies to all 
types of relationships, whether heterosexual, same sex, transgender or 
familial (non-intimate partner). They should probe the situation and be 
aware that the primary aggressor is not necessarily the person who was 
first to use force or threatening behaviour in the current incident. 

They should examine whether: 

 the victim may have used justifiable force against the suspect in self-
defence 

 the suspect may be making a false counter-allegation 

 both parties may be exhibiting some injury and/or distress 

 a manipulative perpetrator may be trying to draw the police into 
colluding with their control or coercion of the victim, by making a false 
incident report 

Counter-allegations require police officers to evaluate each party’s 
complaint separately and conduct immediate further investigation at the 
scene (or as soon as is practicable) to determine if there is a primary 
perpetrator. 

If both parties claim to be the victim, officers should risk assess both. 
There may also be circumstances where the party being arrested 
requires a risk assessment, as in the case of a victim retaliating against 
an abuser. Officers should bear in mind the possibility that the 
relationship is a mutually abusive one. 

When investigating counter-allegations, officers should note and record: 

 body language 

 comparative severity of any injuries inflicted by the parties 

 whether either party has made threats to another party, child or 
another family or household member 

 whether either party has a history of abuse or violence 



 whether either party has made previous counter-allegations 

 whether either party acted defensively to protect him or herself or a 
third person from injury 

 what any third party witnesses say 

Conducting a thorough investigation into the incident will help officers to 
determine the facts of the situation, see investigative development. 

For further information see: 

 Dual arrests 

 CPS Domestic Abuse Guidelines for Prosecutors, Self defence 
and counter-allegations(opens an external website in the same 
tab) 

First responder as a witness 
First responders are witnesses and should prepare or give a detailed 
statement to be included with any prosecution file. If this is by interview at 
a later stage, supervisors should be mindful that dealing with domestic 
abuse incidents may sometimes trigger an officer to disclose personal 
experience of domestic abuse and they should be prepared to offer 
welfare support if this happens. 

Checklist: Statement of the first officer at the scene 

Statements should, where relevant, cover the officer’s initial appraisal of: 

 victim’s injuries 

 suspect’s injuries 

 presence of children and any injuries they have sustained 

 any damage to property 

 signs of ongoing disturbance on arrival at the scene, for example, 
shouting heard at the premises 

 observations of the physical scene, for example, overturned furniture, 
broken ornaments, marks on clothing 

 evidence of disturbance outside the property 

 demeanour of the suspect, victim and witnesses, including children 



 any details which may be indicative of controlling or coercive 
behaviour – this may be a combination of comments by either the 
perpetrator or the victim, body language or any other details 
observed 

 identification of risk factors – this may include the officer’s opinion 
(supported by reasoning) of the current or potential risk to the 
victim(s) and any children, or to the suspect, for example, suicide 

 allegations made by the victim 

 comments made by the victim or witnesses at the scene – if they do 
not subsequently make a statement, these may still be admissible 
as res gestae or hearsay 

 unsolicited comments/significant statements made by the suspect 
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